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China is a Staunch Force for
Safeguarding World Peace

——Important Statements on International Situation
and China Foreign Policy

In September 1997, the 15th National
Congress of the Communist Party of China
was solemnly convened in Beijing. The
theme of the Congress was “Holding High
the Great Banner of Deng Xiaoping Theory
for an  All-around Advancement of the
Cause of Building Socialism With Chinese
Characteristics into the 21st Century”
General Secretary Tiang Zemin delivered a
report to the Congress, which was divided
into ten parts. The report gave an in-depth
review of the Chinese history over the past
century and Jooked forward to the future
prospect, comprehensively expounded the
historical status and guiding significance of
Deng Xiaoping Theory, the basic line and
program of the primary stage of socialism in
China, economic restructuring and eco-
nomic development strategy, political re-
structuring and construction of democracy
and legal system, international situation and
China's foreign policy.

On the intemationsl situation and
Ching’s foreign policy, Jiang Zemin
stressed, China is & staunch force for safe-
guarding world peace and regional stability,
the development of China does not pase &
threat to any country, and China shall never
seek hegemony.

Jiang Zemin said, at present, the inter-
national situation as a whole is becoming
more relaxed. Peace and development are
the main themes of the present era. The
trend toward multipolarity has further de-
veloped globally or regionally in the politi-
cal, sconommic and other fields. World forces
are experiencing & new split and realign-
ment. Relations between the big powers are
undergoing major and profound readjust-
ments. Regional and  intercontinental or-
ganisations of cooperation are active as
never before. The overall strength of the
great number of developing countries is
srowing, The development of the trend to-
ward multi-polarity contributes to warld
peace, stability and prosperity. The call of
the people of all countries for treating each
other on an equal footing and living to-
gether in  amity is becoming louder and
louder. It has become the mainstream of the
times to long for peace, seek cooperation
and promote development. The factors for
safeguarding world peace are gaining
strength. For a fairly long period of time 10
come, it will be possible to avert & new
world war and secure a favourable, peaceful
international environment and maintain
good relations with the sarrounding coun-
tries.
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War mentality still exists, and hegemonism
and power politics continue 10 be the main
source of threat to world peace and stabil-
ity. Expanding military blocs and strength-
ening military alliances will not be condu-
cive to safepuarding peace and security.
The unjust and irrational old international
economic order is still infringing upon the
interests of developing countries, and the
gap in wealth is widening. Tt is still serious
that human rights and other issues are used
to interfere in the internal affairs of other
countries. Local condlicts due to ethnic, re-
ligious and territorial factors crop up from
time to time. The world is not yet tranquil.

Tiang emphasised, in international af-
fairs, China should determine her position
and policies by proceeding from the fun-
damental interests of the people of China
and other countries and judging each case
on its own merits. China shall not yield to
any outside pressure or enter into alliance
with any big power or group of countries,
nor shall China establish any military bloc,
join in the arms race or seek military ex-
‘pansion

Jiang stressed the opposition to he-
gemonism and the maintenance of world
peace. All countries should settle their dis-
putes and condlicts through peaceful consul-
tations instead of resorting to force or the
threat of using it. No country should inter-
fere in the internal affairs of another country
under any pretext still less bully the weak,
invade or subvert other countries. China
does not impose her social system and ide-
ology upon others, nor will China allow
other countries to force theirs upon her. All
countries are entitled to choose the social
systems, development strategies and life-
styles that suit their own conditions. The
affairs of a country should be decided upon
by its own people, and global issues should
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be dealt with through consultations by all
countries.

Jiang deliberated the good-neighbourly
policy to be upheld. China should settle the
disputes between China and the surrounding
countries through friendly consultations and
negotiations. Should this fail to serve the
purpose, China should put them aside for
the time being, seeking common ground
while reserving differences. China should
further strengthen her solidarity and co-
operation with the Third World countries.
China should further improve and develop
her relations with developed countries on
the basis of the Five Principles of Peaceful
Coexistence. All countries should respect
cach other and live together in amity regasd-
less of differences in their social systems
and ideologies. They should seek the point
where their common interests converge, ex-
pand mutually beneficial cooperation and
work together to take up the challenge fac-
ing mankind for survival and development.
They should persist in dialogae, not con-
frontation, in properly handling their differ-
ences by proceeding from their long-term
interests and the overall task of promoting
world peace and development. China is op-
poscd 10 imposing or threatening to impose
sanctions without good resson. Pursuant to
the principle of equality and mutual benefit,
China should conduct extensive trade, eco-
nomic and technological cooperation and
scientific and cultural exchanges with all
countries and regions to promote common
development. China should take an active
part in multilateral diplomatic activities and
give Tull play to China’s role in the United
Nations and other international organisa-
tions. On the basis of the principles of inde-
pendence, complare equality, mutual respect
and non-interference in each other’s internal
affairs,  (Continued to page 25)
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Chinese President Jiang Zemin made &
state visit to the United States from October
26 to November 2, 1997 at the invitation of
US President Bill Clinton. During his eight-
day stay in the United States, President Ji-
ang held in-depth falks with President
Clinton and other American leaders on
Sino-US relations and other international
and regional issues of mutual concern. A
Joint Statement was issued at the end of the
visit. Both sides decided that China and the
United States should strengthen coopera-
tion and build a constructive strategic part-
nership oriented toward the 215t century to
promote world peace and development
They also agreed on setting up a regular
‘meeting mechanism between the top leaders
and signed a series of accords on economic
and trade cooperation.

The following is a summary of the visit.
After visiting Honolulu and Williams-
burg, President Jiang arrived in Washington
D.C. on October 28. President Clinton held
& welcoming ceremony for President Jiang
on the morning of October 19. In his
speech, President Clinton said President Ji-
ang’s visit provided an opportunity for im-
proving the Sino-US relationship, an oppor-
tunity that enabled both China and the
United States to bolster their ties, address
their disputes in a candid and mutually re-
spectful manner, and work together for a
better world at the threshold of a new mil-
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lennium, Looking shead, President Clinton
said, one can see that China’s economic and
political dynamism will undoubtedly exert a
far.ceaching influence on the world in the
21t century.

Tn s reply speech, President Tiany said,
he came to.the United States to increase
mutwal understanding, expand common
ground, develop cooperation, work to-
gether for a better future and usher the
Sin-US. relationship inio & new stage of
growth.

Under the changed intemational situa-
tion, President Jiang said, China and the
United States are seeing more common in-
terests than before and their potential for
cooperation is growing.- The two countries
share & wide range of common interests and
shoulder common responsibilities on issues
bearing on the survival and development of
humanity. We should view and handle our
celationship from a historical and strategic
point of view. He expressed the hope that
the Sino-US relationship can serve as an ex-
ample for countries with different traditions,
cultures and social systems and at different
stages of development to conduct their re-
lations on the basis of mutual respect,
peaceful coexistence snd common devel-
opment

In ks talks with US leaders, President
Jiang pointed out that there is huge poten-
tials to be tapped for China and the United
States to cooperate with each other. It is
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the aspiration of both the Chinese people
and American people and all peace-loving
peoples in the world that China and the
United States expand their common ground
and step up cooperation in various fields.

President Clinton expressed the hope
that the two countries boost their co-
operation in areas such as world peace,
stability and secusity, United Nations af-
fairs, major regional issues, environmental
protection, anti-drug trafficking and inter-
national finance. The United States wished
to see China’s early entry into the World
Trade Organisation

When talking about the Taiwan ques-
tion, President Jiang reiterated that the issue
as always been the most sensitive and most
important one in the Sino-US relationship.
The strict US observance of the three joint
communiques signed between the two
countries, particularly a proper handling of
the Taiwan question by the Usited States, is
the prerequisite for the long-term, healthy
and stable development of Sino-US rela-
tions,

President Clinton pledged that the US
government would continue to abide by the
“bne China” stance and observe the princi-
ples laid down in the three communiques.
The United States does not support Taiwan
becoming independent, Taiwan joining the,
United Nations, or any move aimed at creat-
ing ‘two Chinas” or ‘one China, one Tai-
wan”,

The two countries released s Joint
Statement on October 29 in Washington
D.C. The statement says, the two presi-
dents have had an in-depth and productive
exchange of views on the international
situation, China-US relations and the impor-
tant opportunities and challenges facing the
two countries. A sound and stable relation-
ship between China and the United Statcs
serves the fundamental interests of both the
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Chinese and American peoples and is im-
portant to fulfil their common responsibili-
ties to work for peace and prosperity in the
21st century. While China and (he United
States have areas of both agrecment and
disagreement, they have significant common
interests and a firm common will to seize
opportunities and meet challenges coopera-
tively, with candour and determination, to
achieve concrete progress.

The two presidents are determined to
build toward a constructive strategic part-
nership between China and the United
States through increasing cooperation to
meet international challenges and promote
peace and development in the world. To
achieve this goal, they agree to approach
China-US relations from a long-term per-
spective on the basis of the principles of the
three China-US joint communiques.

As twa major countries in the Asia-
Pacific region, China and the United States
are ready to strengthen their cooperation to
meet various challenges and make positive
contributions 1o promoting stability and
prospetity in the region

The two presidents agreed on a number
of steps that will provide a framework for
further promoting China-US relations and
strengthening their cooperation in interna-
tional affairs.

High-Level Dialogue and Consultations

China and the United States agree to
regular visits by their presidents to each
other's capitals.

They agree to a Beijing-Washington
presidential communications link to facili-
tate contact

They also agree to regular exchanges of
visits by cabinet and sub-cabinct officials to
consult on political, military, security and
arms control issues.
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China and the United States reaffirm
the importance of bilateral cooperation
across the broad range of environmental is-
sues, as evidenced by the establishment of
the China-US Forum on Environment and
Development in March 1997,

They consider it a critical challenge to
develop and efficiently use energy re-
sources, protect the global environment,
and promote environmentally sound growth
and development. Accordingly, they agree
to strengthen their cooperafion in enetgy
and environment through an initiative to ac-
celerate clean energy projects and the ap-
propriste transtor of related techrologies.

Econamic Relations and Trade
The two presidents are prepared to take
positive and eflective measures to expand
China-US trade and economic ties.

Peaceful Nuclear Cooperaiion

China and the United States agree that
it is in their mutual interests to cooperate in
the peaceful use of nuclear energy. China’s
State Planning Commission and the US De-
partment of Energy have signed a Letter of
Tntent to promote nuclear co-operation and
research between the two countries.

The Joint Statement also addresses the
issues of non-proliferation, human rights,
cooperation in the filed of law, military-to-
military relations, science and technology,
education and cultural exchange.

President Jiang invited President Clin-
ton to visit China in 1998, and President
Clinton accepted the invitation with pleas-
ure.

eriat V. as:

At a press conference held on October
29, the two leaders admitted that they still
have differences, and they agreed that these
could be worked cut only through dialogue
and discussions. The differences should not
affect their expanded caaperation in vasious
areas.
On October 30, President Tiang spoke
on principles guiding Sino-US relations to-
‘ward the 21st century at a luncheon hosted
by the American-China Society and five
other American organisations. These prin-
ciples are:

Viewing and handling China-US rele-
tions from & strategic and long-term per-
spective and keeping a firm grip on the
overall interests of the bilateral relations;

Vigorously secking the converging
point of the common interests, taking into
account not only one’s own interests but
also that of the other side;

Strictly observing the three China-US
joint communiques which form the basis of
a growing relationship;

Handling differences through consulta-
tions on an equal footing in the spirit of
mutual respect, ‘seeking common ground
while putting aside differences; and handling
the Taiwan issue properly.

During his visit, President Jiang also
met US Vice-President Al Gore, Congres-
sional leaders and other American leaders.
Talks were also held between Chinese Vice-
Premier and Foreign Minister Qian Qichen
and US Secretary of Statc Madeleine Al-
bright

President Jiang described his visit as
“having achieved the expected goals” and
“fully successful”.
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China and Japan Forge Friendly Ties
Oriented Toward the 21st Century

The year 1997 marked the 25th anni-
versary of the normalisation of diplomatic
relations between China and Jepan. To
celebrate the event, Chincse Premier Li
Peng visited Japan November 11-16 at the
invitation of the Japanese government.

The visit represented a major diplo-
matic move by the Chinese government.
During his visit, Premier Li held in-depth
talks with Japanese officials both in and out
of the government on how to further cx-
pand Sino-Japanesc relations and bilateral
cooperation. Leaders of the two countries
exchanged views and reached a consensus
on building an endurable good-neighbourly
friendship betwoen their two peoples for
gencrations 1o come. They also agreed on
an exchange of visits between top leaders of’
the two countries.

At a reception given in his honour by
seven institutions favouring Sino-Fapanese
friendship, Premier Li explained the Chinese
goverment’s five principles guiding Sino-
Japanese relations.

Mutual respect and non-interference in
each other’s internal affuirs, That entails a
respect for the choice of path of develop-
ment made by the people of each couniry in
fine with their own national conditions, and
the need to transcend differences in sociat
systems, ideologies and values and to coex-
ist peacefully as good neighbours.

Secking common ground while shelving
differences when it comes to disputes. The

two countries must adhere strictly to the
principles enshrined in the Sino-Japanese
joint comuniques and the Treaty of Peace
and Friendship and maintain their friendship
by handling their disputes of today and fu-
ture wiscly through consultations and free
from interference of any sort, Differences
and disputes should not be allawed to be-
come stumbling block te improve relations.

Increasing dialogues at all levels and in
all arzas, enhancing mutual understanding,
building up trust and expanding common
ground

Conducting economic and trade co-
operation on the basis of equality, mutual
benefit and reciprocity, and from a long-
term perspective in order to make up for
cach other’s deficiencies and achieve com-
mon development.

Fostering friendship for generations to
come. On the one hand, we should inherit
and expand the traditional friendship and
coopetative ties existing between the two
countries. On the other hand, we should
also educate and guide our younger genera-
tions with a correct historical perspective.
Only by so doing can Sino-Tapanese friend-
ship be carried on for generations to come.

Both China and Japan are important
countries in Asia and the world at large,
Premier Li ssid. In a significantly changed
wotld moving increasingly toward multipo-
larity, building and developing long-term
and stable friendship {Continued to page19)
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Strategic Cooperative Partnership Established
Between China and Russia

At the invitation of President Jiang
Zemin of the People’s Republic of China,
Russian President B. Yeltsin visited China
from November 9 to 11, 1997. This is his
third state visit to China since he assumed
the office.

Holding the fifth summit on the mormn-
ing of October 10, President Jiang Zemin
and Russian President Yeltsin came ta
unanimous agreement, over the past 6
years, the Sino-Russian relations have re-
corded fruitful results, and also accumulated
a lot of valusble experience. Practice has
born out that the established Sino-Russian
strategic cooperative partnership oriented
towards the 21st century, featuring good-
neighbourliness, co-operation on equal
footing, and common developmertt, neither
seeking alliance nor confrontation, not tar-
geting against the third country, is fully
meeting the  fundamental interests and de-
sires of the two peoples and beneficial to
peace and stability in the region and in the
‘world 2s 2 whole.

President liang Zemin satisfactorily
pointed out, the Sino-Russizn relationship
has a clear-cut orientation for development,
which is the established strategic coopera-
tive partnership based on equality and mu-
tual trust and oriented towards the 21st
century; has a solid political foundation
formed by all the joint statements and other
documents, by which both sides undertake
obligations of strictly observing the princi-
ples of mutual respect, equality and mutual
trust, cooperation for mutual benefit and
common development in the bilateral rela-
%

tions; has a guarantce of the effective
mechanism, which is the established
mechanism for the regular meetings be-
tween heads of the two states, between
premiers and consultations between  the
foreign ministers. Followed by the estab-
lishment and operation of Sino-Russian
Committee for Friendship, Peace and De-
velopment, friendship and mutual under-
standing hetween the peoples from different
sectors of the two countries will be
strengthened, the social basis of the Sino-
Russian friendly co-operation will become
stronger. All these developments lead us to
‘believe that the Sino-Russian relations enjoy
faily broad  prospect for development,
which will not only benefit still better the
peoples of the two countries, but will also
exert greater healthy impact on the devel-
opment of the international situation and
global relations. The Chinese side is ready
to join the Russian side for making con-
certed efforts to comprehensively advance
the bilateral strategic co-operative partner-
ship between the two countries into the 21st
century.

President Yeltsin expressed his agree-
ment with President Jiang's views. He
noted, Russia and China have established
strategic cooperative partnership oriented
toward the 21st century. This relationship is
based on trust and friendship, does not only
have concrete political and economic con-
tent, but also enjoys the personal concerns
and cultivation of the heads of the two
states.
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President Yelisin pointed out, there is
no problem existing between Russia znd
China, and the bilateral relations will con-
tinue to advance after the current summit.

The heads of state of China and Russia
declared officially that the demarcation of
the eastern section of Sino.Russian border
had been completed.

President Jiang stated, that is a major
event of significance in the Sino-Russian
relations. The two countries have already
signed two agreements on the common
border, and also other important documents
such as the five-country agreement on con-
fidence-building and on disarmament along
the common border. The fact that thesc
agreements have been reached together
with the settlement of demarcating the bor-
der is 2 successful example of fairly and rea-
somably solving the problet inherited from
history by consultations on equal-footing,
rutual understanding and murual accom-
modation, a powerful guarantee for the
ever-lasting peace, tranquillity, development
and prosperity.

President Yeltsin said, the two coun-
tries bave settled the problems having re-
mained unsotved for several decades, which
is the concrete manifestation of the friendly
cooperation between ouc two counries
The fact that Russia and China share a
peaceful and stable border is in the funda-
mental interests of the two peoples.

On trade and economic relations, Presi-
dent Jiang pointed out, Sino-Russian trade
and economic relations have already had a
sound base, the two countries should put in
greater cfforts for fully tapping the great
potentials and advances of each side, pio-
neering new arcas and channels of co-
operation and especially making break-
throughs in the large and medium-sized
projects of long-term coaperation

Seriat Pods

President Yeltsin responded, there is a
strong mutual complementarity in the Rus-
sian-China economic cooperation, the two
countries already have many good projects
and proposals for expanding economic co-
operation and trade, hence, the cooperation
should be enhanced and implementation of
the projects and proposals be speeded up.

On October 10, the heads of state of
China and Russia signed the Sino-Russian
Joint Statement. The Statement points out,
the positive actions China and Russia have
taken 10 build 2 multipolar world, and a new
and comparatively perfected international
political and economic order have received
wide-spread  acknowledgement from the
international community, and have exerted
healthy influence on the international situa-
tion as the turn of the century approaches.

The Statement specifies that the Sino-
Russian relations are in no way targeted
against any third country and the two
countries do not seek hegemony, for ex-
pansion.

China and Russia believe that the time
when countrics forged alliances and en-
gaged in strategic integration targeted
against the third country has passed. In the
new century, mutual trust and co-operation
on equal footing, and the coherence of di-
versification between nations will guarantee
peace and prosperity for mankind

The Statement says, the two sides
highly value the important role of the pre
ous four joint statements signed by the Chi-
nese and Russian heads of state in actively
propelling the bilateral relations and in af-
fecting the establishment of strategic co-
operative partnership based equality and
trust and oriented toward the 21t century.

Of the nine areas for sirengthening bi-
tateral cooperation, No. 6 specifies that the
development of ties in the area of military

technology is an (Continued to page 18}
]
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Five Principles for Developing Good-Neighbourly
Relations With ASEAN

On August 22, 1997 in Malaysia, visit-
ing Chinese Premier Li Peng delivered a
speech entitled Towards a Relationship of
Friendship and Good Neighbourliness
Geared 10 the 21st Century, elaborating the
foliowing principles for developing relations
between China and the ASEAN countries:

—Respecting  each other and
treating each other as equals. China has
always maintained that each and evary
country in the world has the right to choose
its own political structure or development
pathin light of its sational conditions. Other
countries are not allowed 1o interfere in any
way. In the view of China, all countries, big
or small, strong ar weak, rich or poot, are
equal members of the international com-
munity and are entitled to participate in re-
gional and internationa! affairs on an equal
footing, Such rights should be fully re-
spected.

—Strengthening dialogue and in-
tensifying consultation. The full dialogue
parthership estahlished between China and
ASEAN represents an important channel for
closer dialogue and consultation. We should
further increase exchanges between leaders
and other people for a broader exchange of
views on issues of common concern, with &
view to increasing mutual understanding
and broadening consensus

—Seeking common development
based on mutual benefit. As economic
factors gain importance in international re-
Tations, economic cooperation has becotne a
major underpinning in the development of

10

state-to-state relations. China and ASEAN
countries have their respective strong
points. These advantages in such fields as
natural resources, technological know-how,
capital and markets can complement one
another. The potential for economic coop-
esation is indeed enormous, the range of
cooperation is broad, and the prospects for
cooperation are highly promising. We can
draw on each other’s ich experience in eco-
nomic development to make up for our own
deficiencies, for the purpose of achieving
commion developnient.

—Supporting each other and ex-

panding cooperation. We should step up
our mutual assistance and co-ordination at
the UN, APEC, ASEM and ARF in order to
safeguard the shared rights and interests of
developing countries.
Bearing in mind the larger pic-
ture, seeking common ground while put-
ting aside differences. While we share
‘broad commen interests in the development
of state-to-state relations, it is inevitable
that certain disputes or differences will oc-
cur. Efforts should be made to seek a grad-
ual solution to problems. This requires a
forward-looking approach with friendly
consultations on an equal footing. As for
differences and disputes that cannot be re-
solved for the time being, they can be ap-
proached in the spirit of seeking common
ground while shelving differences. They
need not hinder the development of normal
relations.
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Some Thoughts on the Security Issues
in the Asia-Pacific Region

by Chen Jifeng

L Rapid Ecomomic Growth and
Peaceful and Stable International Envi-
ronment

Since the 19805, economy in the Asia-
Paific region has maintained the momen-
tum of rapid growth. The economic
achievements in China and the ASEAN
countries have all the more evoked much
admiration. In a sense, the economic de-
velopment in Bast Asia was the
“locomative” of world economic rejuvens-
tion and prosperity. Countries in East Asia
share common interests in economic devel-
opment, and at the same time there are also
contradictions and conflicts existing among
them. However, driven by common inter-
ests, the countries no longer consider dif-
ferences or similarities of their political
systems and  ideologies as preconditions
for international co-operation, but instead,
regard economic factors and security issugs
as the starting point and motive forces for
promotion of mutual co-operation. Eco-
nomic development within a country and
economic co-aperation with foreign coun-
tries all need the enhancement of cohesion
among the countries in this region, require
economic organisations to co-ordinate eco-
nomic activities as the ASEAN Free-Trade
Zooe, aud mechanism of dialogue as the
ASEAN Regional Forum (ARF) to discuss

security issues. The purpase is to properly
handle various contradictions and prob-
lems asising from economic co-operation,
mitigate conflicts or threats to security
caused by intensified contradictions, so as
to safeguard the basic interests of common
development and prosperity.

Tt is against the above-mentioned back-
ground and reasons that people  can ex-
plain why the Asia-Pacific region-—-a re-
gion with such complicated ethnic compo-
sitions, different historical & cultural tradi-
tions, religious beliefs, social systems and
ideologies, uneven economic levels and
military  strength, and varied sizes and
population--—-has maintained relative politi-
cal stability, and sustained economic devel-
opment, diminished former hot spots, en-
hanced the momentum of peace and stability
and mitigated potential contradictions and
conflicts through peaceful consultations and
dialogues. With the end of the Cold War,
countries of this region, by keeping abreast
of the historical trend of peace and devel-
opment, have put economic development as
top priority of their national strategies and
accordingly readjusted their foreign policies
by seeking complementarity, pursuing co-
operation, and solving contradictions, con-
flicts and disputes aver territories or terri-
torial waters left over by history through
peaceful means instead of resorting to

n




[image: image12.png]forces or military confrontation. Based on
the economic development strategies of
most countries in this region and the mili-
tary security strategies which are condi-
tioned by the former, we may make an op-
timistic prediction that the existing various
unstable and uncertain factors in this region
shall not lead to large scale armed conflicts
ot local wars involving major states. People
have reasons to helieve that the Asia-Pacific
region in the 2{st century will be a new re-
gion featured by economic vitality and
prosperity, progress of democracy in poli-
tics, and the contentment of peaple in life
and work,

1. Two Concepts of the Security and
Uncertainties in the Security in the
Asia-Pacific Region

Peace and stability are common aspira-
tions of the countries in the Asia-Pacific
region. The countries also hope to enhance
co-operation in the ficld of security, but
their understanding of peace and co-
aperation is quite different, and their views
are far divergent on principles and practices
relating to peace and co-operation. There
are two propositions in general. One is to
establish a security system dominated and
maripulated by 2 certain country, and sub-
ordinated to the interests of this country.
Obviously, this will not be accepted by
most of the countries in the Asia-Pacific
region. The other proposition propounded
by developing countries is that dialogues
and consultations should be applied to
state-to-state relations; all the countries, big
or small, rich or poor, strong or weak, are
all equal members of the international com-
munity; issues on security and co-operation
should be discussed by all the parties in line
with the diversity and reality of the regio;
countries concerned shall conduct dialogues

and political consultations on security mat-
1

5

ters in different forms and through diffcrent
channels, and formulate confidence-building
measures(CBMs). The ASEAN Regional
Forum (ARF) is a multi-lateral regime for
dialogues on regional security co-operation.
Being an extension of the ASEAN, the Fo-
rum has also registered somc break-
throughs. In sccordance with the principles
and objectives of the Forum, the members
of the Farum can hold dialogues and ex-
change ideas in an atmosphere of co-
ordination and understanding, and thus at-
taining consensus gradually. With a view to
the lofty goal of maintaining peace and
stability in the Asia-Pacific region, East
Asia in particular, members of the Forum
frankly expound views on security co-
operation in this region. Therefore, the Fo-
rum plays an important tole in promoting
mutual understanding, eliminating differ-
ences, enhancing mutual confidence, and
safeguarding peace and stability. Tt is be-
coming the major channel for multilateral
dialogues on regional security and co-
aperation. It is obvious that these are posi-
tive factors and successful experiments in
the security mechanism in the Asia-Pacific
region

However, an undeniable fact is that
peace and  stability in the Asia-Pacific re-
gion are characterised by relativity and vui-
nerability. The existing instabilities and un-
cenainties might imperil peace and security
in this region if improperly handled. Even
though people still have reasens to be op-
timistic about the future, however they can
not ignore the unfavourable factors.

‘What is the most negative factor en-
dangering security in this region? The an-
swer is "Cold War mentality” and the prac-
tices of hegemonism. People should be on
true alert against the fact that the Cold War
mentality still exists and functions although
the Cold War has come to an end and that




[image: image13.png]Feiice:: Decomber 1997

hegemonistic practice has impaired normal
state-to-state relations, and also peace and
stability in concerned areas.

What should be especially noted is that
the Cold War mentality also manifests itself
inthe continuation of reinforcement of the
alliance formed during the Cold War. The
US military altiances in this region such as
the US-Japan alliance ar¢ products of the
Cold War. People have reasons to express
their concern over the US-Japan alliance
and the orientation Japan fotlows hereafter
Their negative effects on the security in
Last Asia should also not be ignored.

Last year, the United States and Japan
signed the US-japan Joint Declarstion on
Security Alliance, and this year they revised
the Guideline of Japan-US Defence Co-
operation and issued & mid-term report, in
an attempt to redefine the areas of defence
covered by the US-Japan security pact. The
Cold War has come 10 an ead, yet the US
and Japan have made major madifications
te the US-Japan mifitary co-operation,
stipulating that the Japanese military forces
should emerge in the areas surrounding Ja-
pan when Japan and the Unites States deem
it necessary. This is the core of the mid-
term report of the "Guideline of Japan-US
Defence Co-operation”, swhich will be taken
as the first basis of legal principle by the
Japanese military forces to expand from its
own territory to its peripberal arcas. Natu-
rally this move has incurred ulmost con-
cern from the public inside Japan and of
countries concerned in Asia. As everyone
knows, after World War 11, the interna-
tional community has banncd Japan from
rearming itself. Howeves sccording to the
modified principle now, the armed forces of
Tapan will expand to the "areas surrounding
Japan", How large on earth are the sur-
rounding areas? Which placcs da they
cover? The Japamese and  American

sertal Nodt:
authorities have evaded answers the public
are much concemned with. What on earth
are their real motives? In view of the atti-
tudes of some rightist forces in Japan to-
wards history, people have ta doubt about
and guard against the role of Japan in the
East Asian security. Since the end of World
War 1L, the war crimes committed by Japan
have not yet been thoroughly exposed and
crificised Consequently different kinds of
events which are hard for people to under-
stand and accept arise one after another.
For instance, some influential Japanese
politicians constantly make public speeches
denying the history of aggression, and pay
bomage 1o the Yasukuni Shrine. Especially
the Japancse government has contimuously
expanded its armament, and increased its
military budget, now exceeding US $50 bil-
Tion, the second largest in the world just
ter the United States. Iis mititary facilities
are amang the most advanced in the world.
Tt is obvious that Japan bas the intention to
become a political power fram an economic
power. But whal worrics peaple more is Ta-
pan's aspiration to develop its military
forces in order to play a role in the military
affairs. Undoubtedly this is a kind of hidden
trouble endangering peace and stability in
1his region.

Tn the Asia-Pacific region, there also
exist problems left over from the Cold War.
The issue of the Korean Peninsula, an im-
portant issue affecting peace and stability
in Northeast Asia and the Asia-Pacific re-
gion as a whole, can be hardly resofved
radically in a short term,

In the Asia-Pacific rogion, there also
exist other problems left over by history
such as disputes over borders, territories,
and territorial waters, and cthnic and relig-
ious clashes rooted in the long term devel-
opment of history. These contradictions
may become acute. In addition, there is
3
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also the problem of widening gap between
the rich and the poor.

There is also conflict over economic
interests in the Asia-Pacific region, which is
primarily exemplified in scrambling over
‘markets, for an instance, the US-Japan trade
clashes; the rivalry over resources, for in-
stince some countries make sovereign
claims over the Nansha Islands of China.
China has solid basis of historical materials
and legal principles 1o prove that the whole
Nansha Islands, like Xisha, Zhongsha and
Dongsha Islands, are China's territory.
Some countries have disputes with China
over the sovereignty of the Mansha islands
and reefs. Bul taking into account the gen-
eral situation of regional economic devel-
opment and _stability, and the good neigh-
bourly friendship with countries concerned,
China has adopted & positive and rational
attitude on this issue, by proposing the idea
of “engaging common development while
shelving disputes', and by undertaking to
settle disputes through peaceful means in
fine with the principles of the UN Conven-
tion on the Law of Sea, and the Interna-
tional Law. We believe that in the spirit of
good-will and friendship, the dispute aver
the Nansha Islands between China and
countries concerned will be properly sotved
Tt is just meaningless and harmful to inten
tionally exaggerate so-called tension in
South China Sea. What needs to be on
guard against is the instigation and interfer-
ence from outside forces.

The above-mentioned issues are not
isolated but intertwined with each other.
However, the most dangerous arc Cold War
mentality, hegemonism and power politics,
against which people must maintain sharp
vigilance.

1M1 China - an important factor for the

14

Serial :No a3

security and stability in the Asia-Pacific
region

As a big Asian country, China plays an
important rale in the security and stability in
Asia and the world at large. Thanks to the
implementation of reform and opening-up
policy, China has maintained stability in
domestic situation and achieved sustained
and rapid economic growth. Meanwhile, it
hes pushed forward its good-neighbourly
foreign policy. These are all positive contri-
butions made by China to the security and
stability in the Asia-Pacific region. Anyone
who takes an objective, impartial and un-
prejudiced approach toward it will recog-
nise this fact. However, there is another
discordant voice trumpeting "China threat”.
Then, it may be asked: is China a stable
factor or unstable one? Will China's devel-
apment and growth be favourable to the
development and peace of the world, or
otherwise? These are all issues of major
importance.

There is an argument in the West that,
with the growth of its comprehensive na-
tional strength, China will seek "expansion
of its sphere of influence”, therefore, China
is the "root” of tension. Tt is widely known
that, long suffering from the aggression and
plunder by the western powers and the un-
able ruling of the corrupt regime in the past,
China was in a state of poverty and back-
wardness for quite a long time. Not until the
founding of new China, did the situation
begin to improve, Since the adoption of re-
form and opening-up, China has witnessed a
rapid economic growth rate. However,
China is still a developing coimtry. Up to
now, there are over 58 million people in
China who don't have proper food and
clothing yet. To reach the level of 2 medium
developed country, China has to wark very
hard for another half a century. So China
still has a long way to go in the course of
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development. How can China threat others
when she even couldn't get enough time for
its own business?

‘Will China's concentration of efforts on
its economic construction be beneficial or
detrimental to the international community?
The answer is self-evident. The fundamental
goal for China's economic development is to
improve the livelihood of its large popula-
tion. The world today is interdependent,
China's development will only add to the
complementarity of the world and promote
common development of all countries. In
fact, the overall development of China's
economy provides a vast commodity market
and an ideal invesiment venue for the world
and the western countries in particular,
‘which will undoubtedly benefit the western
world as well as the Asian countries. Facts
have proven that China's development, in-
stead of being so-called “threat”, is the very
driving force for economy of the Asia-
Pacific region and the world as a whale. It
is also obvious that China's development
will have positive impact on the stability of
Asia and the world. Only with the develop-
ment of economy, can the Chinese people
live and work in peace and contentment.
Will the wotld enjoy greater stability under
the circumstances that the 1.2 billion Chi-
nese people live in poverty, which may in-
cur famine and internal disturbance, and the
mass exodus of refugees into other coun-
tries?

Another argument from the West is that
the growth of China's military expenditure is
too fast, posing a military threat. China
practises military strategies of active defen-
sive. China neither seeks global and regional
hegemony, nor stations armed forces
abroad, nor projects military bases on for-
eign soil. The national defence construction
of China is tiot directed against any country
and will not constitute a threat to any

Sériat o5

country. China is one of the countries in the
world with the lowest military cxpenditare,
¢ither in terms of absolute amount or rela-
tive indicators. There's no denying the fact
that China's military cxpenditure has in-
creased in recent years, Nevertheless, the
actual increase is quite limited if the element
of inflation rate is allowed. And it is almost
negligible, compared with the military
spending of the United States and Japan, Tn
reality, China's arsenal is not comparable at
all to that of the world military powers.
China is one of the countries that did least
combat-sircraft’s importing in the past dec-
ades. China does not have a single aircraft
carrier so far. How does China threaten the
security of others from the military per-
spective? So the charges of China's military
threat can't hold water al all

In consideration of world history and its
reality, we can see whether 2 country poses
a threat to world peace or not is neither
determined by the strength of that country,
nor by the level of advancement of its mili-
tary equipment, but is up to the foreign
policy it pursues. This has aiready been
confirmed by reality. China pursues an in-
dependent foreign policy of peace and has
always persisted in developing friendly rela-
tions with various countries in the world on
the basis of five principles of peaceful coex-
istence, especially in developing good-
neighbourly relations with surrounding
countrics. China has made unswerving ef-
forts for maintaining peace in this region
and the world at large. Chinese leaders have
reiterated once and again that China does
not and will never seek hegemony. China
will definitely abide by its commitment.
Therefore, the accusations of China threal
deviates from the objective fact,

Then, why do certain people from the
West trumpet  {Continued 1o page 27)
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China's Economy to Follow A Sound Track

Qiu Xiaohua, Chief Economist with the
State Statistical Burcau, recently predicted
China's economic situation in 1998 while
making an authoritative appraisat of the
country’s tmacro-economic  situation  in
1997.

Noticeable results. In 1997, China's
economy changed from a seller’s market to
2 buyer's markct. The goat for an ideal
structure of high economic growth rate and
low price hikes was, in general, achieved.

The GDP for 1997 was estimated to
grow by 8.8 percent, a continuation of the
rapid increase in pervious years. The
growth rate far exceods the world average
level of 4 percent. Consumption growth
was estimated to be 10 percent, correspond-
ing with economic progress.

Low price rises in 1997 laid a good
foundation for the steady development of
the macro-economy and created a sound
environment for the reform of state-owned
enterprises. The 1997 retail price index for
commodities was estimated to rise by 0.8
percent, plummeing from 6.1 pescent in
1996. Many factors contributed to the low
growth rate, including a moderately tight fi-
nancial and monetary policy introduced at
the beginning of the year, fairly good agri-
cultural harvests, the initial formation of a
buycr's market and sufficient supplies,
deepened enterprise reform, and acute mar-
ket competition. These factors also deter-
mine that commodity prices will not bounce
back drastically for some time 1o come.

16

With the continucus development of the
nationa] economy at a moderately repid
speed and the progress of economic restruc-
turing in 1998, the retail price for com-
madities may rise slightly while maintaining
relative stability.

Unfavourable factors. In 1997, there
‘were many factors affecting the sound de-
velopment of the national economy. While
doep-seated problems lay in the irrational
economic structure, those on the surface
included unemployment, difficult operation
of state-owned enterprises and uneven re-
gional economic development

Unemployment,  hidden prablem in the
past, has gradually come to the surface
since reform and opening up. Tn 1997, the
problem became more prominent, with the
urban unemployment rate climbing to 4 per-
cent, By the end of 1997, nearly 10 million
urban employees had been laid off, Mean-
while, the difficulty in the production and
management of partial state-owned enter-
prises became aggravated. By late Septem-
ber, 46.7 percent of state-owned industrial
enterprises had entailed losses, and nearly
600 billion yuan of circulating funds had
been held owing 1o overstocked products.

Tn 1998, China must focus efforts on
tackling the aforementioned unfavourable
factors. The national economy will maintain
the momentum of rapid and steady devel-
opment in 1998 if the current macro-control
policy remains consistent, slight readjust-
ment occurs in a timely manner when the
moderately tight financial policy js adhered
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t0, and external conditions such as the ex-
tent of natural conditions such as the extent
of natural disasters and international eco-
nomic environment are normal. The eco-
nomic growth rate for 1998 is expected ta
stand at 8-10 percent

To remove various unfavourable fac-
tors, efforts should be made in the following
four areas:

Expediting the reform of state-owned
enterprises. The focus should be placed on
strategically readjusting the state-owned
economy, adequately shortening the front
line, expediting capital reorganisation, and
completing structural readjustments on the
basis of technological fenovation for
manufacturing market-orierited products.

Meanwhile, efforts will be made to
speed up the reform of state-owned com-
mercial banks, resolve the problem related
to debts owed by state-owned enterprises to
these banks, and promote as quickly as
possible the central bank's assets liability
management of state-owned commercial
banks, with an eye 1o turning them into
genuine market-oriented commercial banks.

Trplementing the reemployment proj-
ect. Priority will be given to increasing em-
ployment opportunities, strengthening re-
employment training, and expediting the
establishment and completion of unem-
ployment security mechanisms.

Enhancing the central government's
economic management responsibilities while
reducing the economic management scope
of local authorities.

Increasing government transfer pay-
ment to solve the problem of uneven re-
gional economic development Transfer
payment, as an important policy instrument

e Sepiak-NodY

for economic regulation, can not only pro-
mote overall econommic balance, but also re-
adjust structural balance. Tt is also expected
10 accelerate the improvement of conditions
and the environment for economic devel-
opment in the central and westem regions,
expedite the construction of transport fa-
cilities and water conservancy projects, and
remave poverty.

To maintain rapid economic develop-
ment in 1998, efforts should be made to
create a batch of new economic growth
points.

Given China's reality, to make housing
in great demand a new point of economic
plus will not only help ease the housing
shortage in many localities, but also pro-
mote economic progress. To achieve this,
efforts should be made in the following
ways

First, expediting housing reform,
quickly reducing welfare house allocation,
adequately increasing the residents’ in-
comes, and opening the secondary real es-
tate market.

Second, cutting management fees and
lowering housing prices,

Third, actively promoting the sales of
unsold commodity houses, and imposing
economic penalties on real estate businesses
failing to sell such houses within a set time
Timit

At present, the price of commodity
houses far exceeds the sum that most resi-
dents can afford, with that of some even
approaching the price in developed coun-
tries. Purchases may be stimulated through
increasing the residents' incomes, lowering
house prices and standardising property
management

17
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Relief Aids Quick to Quake-1Iit Area

A total of 47 people were killed by an
earthquake which, measuring 6.2 on the
Richter Scale, hit an area 200 km North-
west of Beijing on Jaouary 10 in Hebei
Province.

The earthquake also injured more than
2,000 peaple and destroyed or damaged
70,000 houses.

Afer the earthquake, local residents
tielped each other to survive the horrible
consequences.

People from alf over the country made
donations to help the victims. Materials
were poured into Zhangbei and Shangyi
counties, the hardest-hit areas.

By January 12, the tremor-stricken area
fad already received 13 million yuan RMB
and 120,000 cotton overcoats and quilts.
Tents and sheiters were put up to accom-

{Contirued from page 9)important compo-
nent of bilatera! cooperation. In this regard,
the two countries strictly abide by the
United Nations Charter and respective in-
ternational obligations in order to help safe-
guard security and stability in the region and
in the world as a whole. Sino-Russian co-
operation in the field of military technology
i in no way directed against the third
sountry.

The state visit to China by President
Yeltsin is highly valued by the top leader-

{Contipued from page 24) that “the un-
forgotten past can serve as a teacher for the
future”, can camy a great weight on
maintaining peace and combating sggres-
18

modate 14,000 families in the two coun-
ties.

The Hong Kong Special Administrative
Region (HKSAR) Government donated
HK$6 million (US§770,000) through the
Red Cross Society of Hong Kong. The Tn-
temational Federation of the Red Cross and
Red Crescent (IFRCRC) deposited 500,000
Swiss francs of emergency disaster funds
into the Red Cross Society of China
(RCSC). The RCSC already dispatched
quilts and colton overcoats worth 260,000
yuan RMB to the area.

The Japanese government decided 1o
offer emergency aid to Zbangjiakou. The
agsistance includes US$300,000 in cash and
goods and materials worth 30 million Tapa-
nese Yen, such as generafors, fents and
‘woollen blankets.

ship of bath countries. At the news confer-
ence on October 10, President Jiang stated,
China is ready to join hands with Russia to
constantly consolidate the established Sino-
Russia strategic cooperative parinership.
President Yeltsin pointed out, the Russian-
China relations have recorded sound growth
over the recent years and the two countries
have already established a relationship based
on mutual trust, which is fairly important
for the friendly relations between the two
countries and between the two peoples.

sion, shall play the role of educating youth
in patriotism, inspire them with patriotic
enthusiasm, and make unremitting efforts
for maintaining regional and global pesce.
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INTERNATIONAL EXCHANGES
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CPAPD President He Luli Visits Vietnam and Laos

At the invitation of the Vietnam Peace
Committee (VPC) and the Lao Committee
for Peace and Solidarity (LCPS), a 7-
member delegation of the Chinese People’s
Association for Peace and Disarma-
ment(CPAPD) headed by Mme. He Luli,
Vice-Chairwoman of the Chinese People's
Political Consultative Conference, in the
capacity of the President of the CPAPD,
paid a friendly visit respectively to the So-

(Continued from page 7)
between China and Japan serve not only the
fundamental intcrests of the lwo peoples but
also peace and development in Asiz and the
world. The two countries should be future-
oriented and examine and handle their bilat-
eral relationship from a strategic point of
view. They should guide the bilateral rela-
tionship to develop soundly.

Premier Li concluded, China is commit-
ted to the socialist modernisation. Her goal

cialist Republic of Vietnam from Dec. 15 to
21 and 10 Lao People's Democratic Repub-
lic from Dec. 25 to 29, The visit has re-
sulted in & complete success and played a
positive rale in further promoing the gaod-
neighbourliness between China and Viel-
nem, China and Laos, in expanding ex-
changes and co-operation betwoen the
CPAPD and the VCP, the CPAPD and the
LCPS.

is 10 achieve modernisation by the mid-21st
century, and that requires an international
environment of lasting peace, particularly a
peaceful eavironment with our neighbouring
countries. It is China’s consistent policy to
build and develop long-term, stable, co-
operative and fiiendly ties with Japan,
which niot only benefits the two peoples but
also world peace and human progress.
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Reflection of a Visit to Mongolia and Russia

by Xic Zhigiong

At the invitation cf the Federation of
Mongolian Peace and Friendship Organisa-
tion (FMPF) and the Russian-based Inter-
national Association of Peace Founda-
tions(IAPF), 4 5-member delegation of the
Chinese People's Association for Peace and
Disarmament(CPAPD)  headed by Vice-
President Lin Huaxuan visited Mongolia
Srgm September 29 1o October 4, and then
Russia from October 4 to 13, 1997. The
hosts of the two countries accorded us
warm hospitality and arranged for us great
varieties of itinerary. During the stay in the
two countrics, the delegation held working
sessions and discussions with the FMPF
President Ligden, Secretary-General Bilegt
and the [APF Vice-Chairman Maslin re-
spectively. At thess meetings, the experi-
ence of the major annual activitics were
mutually shared, new measures to
strengthen bilateral friendly co-operation
were explored and frank exchanges on some
issues of common interest such as peace
and dissrmament were held. The delegation
also met some leaders of government de-
partments, the parliament and NGOs in the
two countries. Our hosts in each country
enthusiastically bricfed the delegation of the
‘political and economic reform, development
and major readjustments of their foreign
‘policics, Tn Mongolia, the bost arranged the
delegation to visit a pastoral family on the
outskirts of the Capital Ulaanbaatar. Being
guests to the hospitable herdsman Family
there, we learnt the current production and

2

operation of the farms, and life and income
of a herdsman after the reform. In Russia,
we vigited Tula, where we were shown
around & military~converted enterprise and
were briefed of the new profile of the agri-
cultural and industrial development as well
as the problems confronted. The visit to the
two countries left on us deep impression.

Mongolia  Further Deepens Eco-
nomic Reform and Attaches Importance
to Developing Relations with China,
Russia, the US and Japan

According to the briefings by the Mon-
gofian friends, Mongolia started the process
of pofitical democratisation and economic
privatisation in 1990. Enormous changes
have taken place in the state politics, eco~
nomic structure and livelihood of the people
over the past seven years. In the year of
1996, the democratic coalition government
came to power, which took mare vigorous
measures to speed up economic privatisa-
tion and establishment of a market mecha~
nism. At present, 60% of the Mongolian
state-owned assets and enterprises have
been privatised. The existing 800 or so large
and medium-sized siate-owned enterprises
are planned to complete the privatisation
process through auction by 2000, By then,
the privatisation rate across the country
shall reach 80-85%. Due 1o the limited
source of social capital at home, the Mon-
golian gavernment is enthusiastic to intro-
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tional assistance so a3 to accelerate the
process of economic privatisation. Up to
now, businessmen from Japan, the US, the
Republic of Korea and European countries
besides those from Russia and China have
entered Mongolia one after another, ac-
tively increasing invesiment, establishing
joint-ventures or co-operation. The delega-
tion members saw sufficient commodities at
‘market and learnt that the industrial and ag-
ticultural production are fecovering gradu-
ally under the new mechanism and eco-
nomic activities are becoming flourish,
People generally hold optimistic attitude to
the prospects of the economy,

The Mongolian foreign policy is under-
going some major readjustments with the
development of the political and economic
reform. Meoting the delegation members,
the concerned government oflicials stated
that Mongolia takes as fitst priority its for-
<ign policy to develop good-neighbourly
cooperation with its two big neighbours,
Russia and China, since Mongolia is an in-
land country locatcd between the two
countries. After the 1996 general election,
some changes have occurred to the position
of the party in power, yet the newly-
insugurated democratic coalition govern-
ment announced its continuation of the
policy to further develop good-neighbourly
cooperation with Russia and China as ever.
The government also has worked out a
policy of Mongolia-China relations oriented
10 the 21st century. Our Mongolian friends
belicved that to develop an all-arcund
friendly and cooperative relations among
Mongolia, Russia and China, the three
neighbouring countries sharing common
borders, is not only in the common inter-
ests of the three countries and their peoples,
but can also play an important rale to safe-
guard peace and stability in this region and
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promote regional economic development
The head of the Panel for Mongolian-
Chinese Relationship in the Great Hural (the
Parliament ) spoke highty of the peaceful
and good-neighbourly poficy, equal and
mutual-beneficial economic and trade poli-
cies pursued by China. Tie noted that the
development of China will be conducive to
that of Mongolia, and the fact that China
announced o cut its armed forces by an-
other 500, 000 men within three years is of
great significance to the maintenance of
peace and stability in the region

Parallel to its big efforts to the devel-
opment of good-neighbourly relationship
with Russia and China, the Mongolian gov-
ermment pays close attention to developing
relations with some major countries such as
the US, Japan as well as some important
international  organisations such as the
United Nations, the World Bank, the Asia
Development Bank and the World Trade
Organisation, etc. in the hope of seeking
support and assistance of various kind and
improving its international standing

Russian  Political and Economic
Situation still in Drastic Changes

During the trip 10 Russia, the CPAPD
delegation held meetings with some Duma
members, experts and scholars from the
Far-East Institute of Russia Academy of
Sciences and Vice-Governor of the State of
Tula. We learnt that the political situation in
Russia on the whole has calmed down
somewhat, though serious disagreements
and strained struggle remain unchanged
among the major political parties, neverthe-
less, all of which hope to maintain political
stability and act in accordance with the
Constitution and the Law. Tt so happened
that when the delegation was staying in
Moscow, several parties in Duma proposed
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a vote of non-confidence against President
Yeltsin administration and filed a joint im-
peachment against President himself The
President and the majosity member of Duma.
diffored sharply on a series of issues such as
reform and recently ran into sharp diss-
groement on the issue of Jand policy. A
concession has been reached and the con-
tradiction temporacily relaxed fallowing the
tit for tat trial of strength.

The present Russian economy is in @
period of transition from 2 planned econ-
omy to 8 market one, The large-scale priva-
tisation process still continues, The market
economic mechanism has not taken shape,
and diversified form of mapagement and
operation exist side by side. The economy
has basically stopped the large scope sliding
and has started to show recavery, with the
high inflation rate being brought under gen-
eral control. There are adequate commo
ties at the market and the prices were com-
paratively stable. However, the gap be-
tween the rich and the poor is widening in
Russian society with the step-up of eco-
nomic reform and privatisation process.
Statistics show that there are 20% of the
total popufation living befow the poverty
line in Russia. In this respect, our Russian
friends generally held that it would take
fong-term cfforts for their country to re-
cover completely and obtain a stable devel-
optnent

On the issue of east-expansion of
'NATO, the Russians friends from all walks
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of life, with whom the delegation had dis.
cussions, expressed Strong  opposition
against it. They held that the east-
expansion of NATO is the result of the
Cold War mentality of Western countries
fed by the US, aims at disintegrating the
former USSR and East Europesn countries,
expands the sphere of influence of the US
and major West European powers, and
contains the development of Russian influ-
ence. So if this move goes unchecked, it
may incur new Instabilities and confionta-
tion in Ewope, which may probably drag
Europe, the US, Russia and even the whole
world inta anothes round of Cold War. It is
impossible for Russia to confront NATO,
but only to take defence posture duc 10 its
weakened overali strength, Our friends in
the Tnternational Association of Peace
Foundations stated that they would unfold
struggles against the eastward expansion of
NATO in order to safeguard peace and
stability in Europe and the world as g
whole.

Taking advantage of the visit to Mon-
golia and Russia, (he CPAPD delegation re-
newed friendship with many old fiiends,
who for long have engaged themselves in
peace activities, and slso made the acquain-
tance of some new friends. The visit helped
to deepen mutugl understanding, promote
friendship and expand friendly co-operation
between the CPAPD and its two host o5~
‘ganisations in Mongolia and Russia.

{The author ts Deyaty Secretary-Genoral, CPAPD)
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Chairman Fundora of the Cuban Movement
for Peace and People’s Sovereignty Visits China

At the invitation of the Chinese Peo-
ple’s Association for Peace and Disarma-
ment(CPAPD), Chairman O. Fundora of the
Cuban Movement for Peace and People’s
Soversignly visited China from August 11
to 17, 1997 That is his second visit to
China since 1988, Tn Beifing, Mr. lhu
Tinggin, Vice-Minister of the International
Department of the Central Committee of
the Conmunist Party of China met Chair-
man Fundora. At the request, Vice-Minister
Liu gave him bricf account of Deng Xiaop-
ing theary of building socialism with Chi-
nese characteristics, and parficularly his
strategic thinking on the independent di-
plomacy of peace. Mr. Jiang Guanghua,
Vice-President of the CPAPD, Deputy Di-
rector of the Foreign Affairs Committce of
the National Committee of the Chinese
People’s Political Consultative Conference,
had a working session with Chairman Fun-
dora. VicePresident Jiang Guanghua
bricfed him of the exuberant celebrations of
the retum of Hong Kong by the Chinese
people and other important events in China.
as well as the work of the CPAPD, ex-
changed views on issues of common cof-
cern such as the international situation, re-
lationship amang big powers etc.. Mutual
understanding between the peace organisa-
tions of China and Cuba was enhanced
through bilateral exchanges. The leadership
of the two peace orgamisations expressed
to further the friendly exchanges between
the two organisations.

Vice-President Jiang Guanghua  ac-
companicd Chairman Fundora to tour Tian-

jin and Shanghai. Mr. Li Shenglin, Deputy
Secretary of Tianjin Municipal Party
Committee and Executive Deputy Mayor
of Tignjin Municipality, and Mme. Chen
Zhili, President of Shanghai Branch,
CPAPD and Deputy Secretary of Shanghai
Municipal Party Committee, respectively
met Chairman Fundora and hosted & dinner
in his honour. During the meetings, the
leadership of both Tianjin and Shanghai
Municipalities gave brief introduction to
development of the local reform and open-
ing-up,

Cuban Embassy in China attached im-
portance to the visit by Chairman Fundora,
and Ambassador J. A, Guera was personally
attending his meetings with Vice-Minister
Liu Jinggin and CPAPD Vice-President Ji-
ang Guanghua

Chairman Fundora, satisfied with the
visit, expressed an idea that the trip genu-
inely made his dream of visiting China come
trug since his visit in 1938 was & short sty
in transit. He was deeply impressed by the
changes in Beijing since 1988 and consid-
ered the changes too great to recognise
Beijing again. He was also informed of the
prosperous development of the socialist
modernisation drive in Tianjin and Shang-
‘hai Muricipalities.

Chairman Fundora toured the Memorial
Muscum of the Chinese People’s War of
Resistance Against Japan at Lugou Bridge.
Deeply struck by the exhibits, he held, this
kind of exhibition has e great historical
value and value for publicity and education,
shall play the role (Continued ta page 18)
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Visits China

At the invitation of the Chinese Peo-
ple's Association for Peace and Disarma-
ment (CPAPD), a 10 member delegation of
American Pennsylvania Peace Lirks headed
by President Anne Kuhn visited China from
September 27 to October 7, 1997. Meeting
the delegation in Beijing, Mme. He Luli,
Vice-Chairwoman of the National Commit-
tee of the Chinesc People’s Political Consul-
tative Conference and CPAPD President
expressed her wishes that the peoples and
the NGOs of the two countries will increase
their exchanges, and make unremitting ef-
forts for the realisation of peace and devel-
opment. At the requests of the visiting for-
eign uests, Mme, He gave a brief account
of the Chinese domesti situation as well as
the state system of multi-party co-operation
and political consultation under the leader-
ship of the Communist Party of China
Holding a working session with the mem-
bers of the delegation, CPAPD Vice-
President Huan Guoying focused on the
work conducted by the CPAPD, the efforts
for maintaining peace, promoting uclear
disarmament and conventional disarmament
by the Chinese people and government. The
two sides also shared experience of con-
ducting the work in their respective coun-
tries, and exchanged views on the interna-
tional issues of common concern. The dele-
gation also called on the Research Institute
of National Minorities under the Chinese
Academy of Social Sciences and toured the
campus of the Central University of Na-
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tional Minorities as well, called on All-
China Women’s Federation and Mrs. Am-
‘bassador Mary Sasser of the United States
to Chiinz was especially invited to be pressnt
at the mesting.

Tn addition to Bejjing, the delegation
also visited Xian, Hangzhou and Shanghai,
where they toured Pudong Development
Zone, joint Venture enterprises, rurs) areas
and sites of historical interests. Mr. Qiu
Changju, Vice-President of Shaanxi Branch,
CPAPD, and Director of the Provincial
Foreign Affairs Office, Mr. Zhou Yuges,
Deputy Secretary-General of the Zhejiang
Provincial Government and Mr. Liang Yu.
fan, Vice-President of Shanghai Branch,
CPAPD, respectively met and hosted a din-
ner in honour of the delegation, and briefed
the delegation of the local developments of
the reform and opening:up.

The leadership of the peace organisa-
tions of China and the United States held
that the exchanges between the NGO peace
organisations can enhance mutual under-
standing, and heip both sides lean from
each other valuable expetience, and the
people to peaple exchanges are conducive
to the further development of the relations
between the two countries. They also be-
lieve that the international exchanges are
beneficial to the devclopment of the cause
of global peace, and the increasing under-
stating among people of all countries are
conducive to the global stability and devei-
opment. They expressed the hope that, fo)-
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lowing President Jisng Zemin’s visit to the
United States and President Clinton’s visit
to China, the bilateral relationship will de-
velop smoothly, and believed that only
through the mutual visits and various ex-
changes can the issue of mutual concern be
communicated and discussed and the nec-
essary measures be adopted to gradually
narrow down the difforences and expand

(Continued from page 3)

the Communist Party of China shall develop
new types of inter-party relations ol ex-
change and cooperation with all political
parties of various counties which are ready
to have contacts with the CPC with a view
to promoting state relations.

Jiang explained, in carrying out the so-
cialist modernisation program, China needs
a long-term peaceful international environ-
ment. China’s development will not pose &
threat  to any other country. China will
never seck hegemony even when it becomes
developed in future. The Chinese people,
for a long time subjected to aggression,
oppression and humiliation by foreign pow-
ers, will never inflict these sufferings upon
others.

Sariai: N6d5

common points so as to advance the Sino-
American relations step by step.

Exchanges and communications helped
promote mutual understanding between the
peace organisations of the two countries,
and leadership from the two peace organi-
sation expressed their intentions to further
the relationship between their two institu-
tions.

With respect to the national defence
and the army building, Jiang Zemin said, the
strenglhening of national defence and army
building arc the fandaments) guesantee for
the national security and modernisation
drive. China should carry out the strategic
principles of active defence, raise the de-
fence capabilifies in the circumstances of
advanced technology and especially the
bightech so as to adapt to the drastic
changes in the global militacy.

Yiang Zemin declared that, in addition
to the army reduction by one million men in
the 1980s, China shall reduce the armed
forces by another 500,000 in the next three
years.
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At the invitation of the Chinese Peo-
ple’s Association for Peace and Disarma-
ment, a S-member delegation of Lao
Commmittee for Peace, Solidarity and Friend-
ship(LCPSF) headed by Dr. Siho Banna-
vong, LCPSF Vice-Chairman and Vice-
Chairman of Lao Front for National Con-
struction visited China from October 19 to
26, 1997 In Beijing, Mme. Chen Muhua,
Vice-Chairwornan of the National People’s
Congress, met and had s cordial conversa-
tion with the delegation. Mr. Dai Bingguo,
Member of the Central Committee of the
Communist Party of China(CCCPC) and
Minister of the International Department,
CCCPC had a cordial meeting with the
delegation and hosted a dinner in honour of
it as well as bricfed the foreign guests of the
Chinese position on the major issues of the
curent international situation. CPAPD
Vice-President Zhu Shanging gave the wel-
coming banquet in honour of the delegation
on behalf of the CPAPD, extended the
delegation 2 warm welcome, briefed the
delegation of the principal cantent of the
15th National Congress of the Communist
Party of China(CPC) and cxchanged views
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on issues of common concern. Besides, the
delegation also visited Shanghai and Kun.
ming, and received a warm welcome from
the Jocal leaders of the Party and govern-
ment and peaple from various fields. The
delegation toured the cconomic and techni-
cal development areas, enterprises, villages,
schools, hospitals, shopping centres as well
as sites of historical interests.

On several aceasions, the delegation of
Lao Committee for Peace, Solidarity and
Friendship, expressed heartfolt congratula-
tions to the victorivus convocation of the
15th National Congress of the CPC and to
the return of Hong Kong to the motherland.
The delegation sincerely wished the frater-
nal Chinese people, under the leadership of
the new generation with General Secretary
Jiang Zemin as the core, to continue to hold
high the great banner of Deng Xiaoping
theory of building socialismt with Chicese
characteristics, record greater achievements
in carrying out the line, principles and poli-
cies adopted at the 15th National Party
Congress, and make important contribu-
tions to peace, stability and development in
Asia as well a3 in the world at large.
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A French Pcace Movement Delegation Visits China

At the invitation of the Chinese People's
Association for Peace and Disarmament
{(CBAPD), & 6-member delegation of Le
Mouvement de la Paix headed by National
Secretary Daniel Durand visited China from
Octaber 25 to November 3, 1997. It was its
fiest visit to China since contacts are estab-
lished botween the two peace institutions.
Mme. He Luli, Vice-Chairwoman of the
National Committee of the Chinese Peo-
ple’s Political Consultative Conference and
President of the CPAPD and Mr. Jiang
Guanghua, Vice-President of the CPAPTY
met and hosted a dinner in honour of the
visiting delegation during duration in
Bejjing. Some Chinese specialists also held

{Continued from page 15)"China Threat™?
Apparenily, it is not accidental. Instead, it
has & profound political background and
complicated reasons.

With the end of Cold War and the disin-
tegration of Soviet Union, the western
countries lost their common encmy. But
the Cold War mentality lingers in a non-
Cold War world. In order to safeguard their
own interests in Asia, certain western
countries are bound to erect a Cold War
peer and make it known as most dangerous
and formidable enemy, which will provide
them with an untenable reason for their po-
fitical and economic interference in Asfan
affairs as well as theoretical grounds for
containing China. Moreover, there is an-
other purposc for those tumpeting "China
Threat”, that is to sow discord between
China and other countries in the Asia-

discussions with the delegation members on
present sisuation of the international arms
control and disarmament. The French dele-
gation called on Archbishop Fu Tieshan of
the Patriotic Catholic Association of Beijing
Municipality. In addition, the delegation
also toured Tianjin and Xian, visited enter-
prises jointly funded by campanies from
China and France, and paid a home visit to
a farmer family. The leaders of both peace
organisations believed that the visit helped
to promote mutual understanding between
the two organisations, thereby laying a
foundation for further cooperation and ex-
changes in the future.

Pacific region, the neighbouring countries in
particular, so as o reach their goal of isolat-
ing China. Apart from it, certain western
countries have enormous military interests
besides cconomic interests in Asia-Pacific
region. Thus, the release of “China Threat"
theory will not only be attempted to help
them maintain theic political and military
influence, but also maintain their occupation
of the Asia-Pacific arms market and seek
their maximum interests.

As an old Chinese saying goes "Peace
and harmony are most valued.” The Chinese
people love peace and long to develop
China's economy in a peaceful and stable
environment, and will, as a result, make
positive contribution to the peace and de-
velopment of the world.

(Ihe authr is Secretary-General, Chinese
People’s Associatian for Peace and Disarmanent )
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A Delegation of the Moscow Branch of
Russian Peace Foundation Visits China

An 8-member defegation of the Moscow
Branch of Russian Peace Foundation
headed by Mme. Lilia P. Slashchova, the
First Deputy President, stayed in Beijing as
the guests of the Chinese Peopie’s Associa-
tion for Peace and Disarmament(CPAPD)
from September 28 to October 2, 1997 on
their way home after their visit to Qingdao

City, Shandong Province. Mr. Jiang
Guanghua, Vice-President of Chinese Peo-
ple’s Association for Peace and disarma-
ment met and entertained the guests. The
Suests were also invited to attend the re-
ception hosted by Prentier Li Peng on the
occasion of the 48th anniversary of the
founding of the People's Republic of China.

Nagasaki Peace Activists Visit China

At the invitation of the CPAPD, a 6-
member Nagasaki delegation of peace activ-
ists, led by Mr. Shigetoshi Fwamatsu,
Chairperson of the Japan Congress Against
A-and-H Bombs (GENSUIKIN) and the
Honorary Professor of the Nagasaki Uni-
versity, paid & friendly visit to Shanghai and
Beifing from December 6 to 11, 1997.
During their stay in Beijing, Mme. He Lufi,
the CPPCC Vice-Chairwoman and the
CPAPD President, met and gave a banquet
10 them.

Qut of gratitude, she awarded a certifi-
cate o the Nagasaki-ken GENSUIKIN and
the Nagasaki-ken Friendship Society of the

2

Victims of Atomic Bomb for their generous
donation to the Peace Primary School in
Dizowo Town, Zhuozhou City, Hebei
Province in 1996.

The Japanese guests were invited to
attend the opening ceremany of the Sth In-
ternational Week of Science and Peace
sponsored by the CPAPD and some other
NGOs in China.

They also visited the Memorial Mu-
seum of the Chinese People’s War of Resis-
tance Against Japan at Lugou Bridge and
received an interview by the reporter of the
CCTV on the issues concerning science and
peace, and Sino-Jepanese relations.




